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EDITORIAL NOTE

I am pleased to declare that International Journal of Medical 
Advances and Discovery is an international, peer-reviewed, 
open access journal that welcomes original research articles 
and reviews of the most current advances and discoveries in 
life sciences, preclinical and clinical medicine, and related 
disciplines. The ISSN of the Journal is 2756-3812. The 
Journals tend to prosper and publish the most complete Source 
of discovery and accurate details on the findings and in all areas 
of the field, recent advances in the mode of original papers, 
analysis, articles, case reports, short communications, etc. 
make them freely accessible online without any limitations or 
any other subscriptions to researchers worldwide.

All published articles of this journal are included in the 
indexing and abstracting coverage of: Chemical Abstracts 
Service (CAS), Academic Resource Index, WorldCat, 
AcademicKeys, Index Copernicus, J-Gate Portal, Electronic 
Journals Library, Citefactor, Genamics JournalSeek and all 
published articles are permanently archived. All published 
articles are assigned to Digital Object Identifier (DOI).

IJMAD is particularly interested in articles that reports 
significant strides in medical research, disease treatment and 
the improvement of patients quality of life. In this sense, 
manuscripts detailing how medical research has transformed 
healthcare, extending and improving the quality of life for 
millions, are welcome.

Authors can submit manuscripts and monitor their progress, 
hopefully for publication, through the online tracking system. 
As any report to be published publicly cumulatively covers 
45 days from the date of receive. The time period for different 
processes including quality control, peer review, and paper 
preparation is taken from 4 to 5 weeks. Performance reviews 
and peer review processes are completed within 14 days, and 
the deadline for submission is just 7 days after the reviewers 
and editors have accepted. 

IJMAD is going to release Volume 8 and Issue 1. Peer-
review is the system used to assess the quality of a manuscript 
before it is published. Qualified researchers in the relevant 
research area assess submitted manuscripts for originality, 
validity and significance to help editors determine whether the 
manuscript should be published or not. 

All articles published by this journal are made freely and 
permanently accessible online immediately upon publication, 
without subscription charges or registration barriers. Also, 
authors of articles published in this journal are the copyright 
holders of their articles and have granted to any third party, 
in advance and in perpetuity, the right to use, reproduce or 
disseminate articles. 

I would like to acknowledge the participation of all writers, 
reviewers and other supportive groups in the final editing of the 
published articles and the editorial assistant’s assistance in the 
timely resolution of IJMAD issues. I am very grateful to them 
for inspiring me to understand the efforts and growth of other 
groups that make to publish articles a successfully

*Corresponding author. Pelechas Eleftherios, E-mail: peleftherios@gmail.com.


